



## Fayette County Public Schools Purchasing Department

205 LaFayette Avenue, LaFayette Educational Center,  
Building A, Fayetteville, GA 30214  
(770) 460-3535 ext. 1043 or [purchasing@fcboe.org](mailto:purchasing@fcboe.org)

### Notice of Intent to Award

Play 2 Learn Program Furniture for Fayette County Public Schools (RFQ 24-003-061)

June 20, 2023

The Fayette County Public Schools Purchasing Department would like to thank all respondents who participated in this solicitation.

The intent of this notice is to communicate the preliminary results of the selection process performed by the Purchasing Department and end-users. This is not an acceptance of your response, nor is it a confirmation of a contract or order. Based on the dollar value of this solicitation, final approval may be required from the Superintendent or the Board of Education as required by policy.

#### Selected Respondent:

School Specialty, LLC  
W6316 Design Drive  
Greenville, WI 54942

#### Award Term:

June 6, 2023 - December 31, 2023

#### The following staff may be contacted for more information:

##### For project coordination including ordering and delivery:

Angie Southers, Director of After School Programs and Early Learning  
770-460-3535 ext. 1038 and [southers.angie@fcboe.org](mailto:southers.angie@fcboe.org)

##### For contract/solicitation questions:

Jamie Marrero, Purchasing Associate  
770-460-3522 or [marrero.jamie@fcboe.org](mailto:marrero.jamie@fcboe.org)

##### For accounts payable or billing information:

Finance Department, Accounts Payable  
770-460-3535 or [invoices.finance@fcboe.org](mailto:invoices.finance@fcboe.org)

#### Attachments:

Tabulations

...

<b>Respondent Name</b>	<b>Score</b>	<b>Total Project Cost</b>	<b>Comments</b>
Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC	35	\$15,284.17	No bid submitted on one (1) item
Kaplan Early Learning Company	30	\$5,812.78	No bid submitted on multiple items
Georgia Specialty Equipment	96.8	\$12,342.55	
School Specialty, LLC	100	\$11,741.58	

Reference	Specification	Points Possible	Points Awarded
<i>General Specifications Scoring</i>			
	Respondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required.	2	2
	Respondent has provided completed solicitation Cost Proposal Sheet(s), as required.	5	5
	Respondent has provided completed Reference Form, as required.	6	6
	Respondent provided Brochures (Product Detail), as required.	5	5
	Respondent has provided Detailed Timeline, as required.	5	5
	Respondent has provided completed solicitation Required Forms sheet (signed), as required.	5	5
	Respondent provided completed Business Capability Form, as required.	7	7
<b>SECTION TOTAL</b>		<b>35</b>	<b>35</b>
<i>Pricing Analysis</i>			
1	Four-in-one Toddler Kitchen: 47 ¾" x 13 ¾" x 40"	AA370	\$759.05
1	Heavy Duty Spacemaker Storage Unit: 48" x 35" x 14 7/8"	DG231	\$854.05
2	Storage Cabinet Wood: 29.61" x 16.02" x 71.50"	JJ188	\$2,088.10
1	18 ½" Heavy Duty Traditional Classroom Chair with Casters Chrome Frame	LC845GA	\$189.05
1	Play Store and Puppet Theater with Dry-Erase Panels: 49 ½" x 15" x 49"	LA805	\$122.55
2	5-Section Coat Locker: 48" x 15" x 50 ½"	JJ106	\$1,328.10
1	Library Book Display: 27.5" x 36" x 13.5"	JJ836	\$293.55
1	2-Shelf Bookcase (Metal or Wood): Metal 34 ½" x 12 5/8" x 41"/Wood 42" x 48"		No Bid
2	25 Cubbies Storage Cabinet with Trays: 35 ½" x 48" x 15"	JJ166+LM103	\$1,546.60
4	All Purpose Storage Unit: 35 ½" x 48" x 15"	JJ195	\$2,200.20
1	Kids Adjustable Height Rectangular Table Red: 30" x 60" x 15"-24"	AB386RD	\$293.55
8	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Red: 13 ½"	EE513RD	\$683.92
1	Kids Adjustable Height Rectangular Table Blue: 30" x 60" x 15"-24"	AB386BU	\$293.55
8	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Blue: 13 ½"	EE513BU	\$683.92
1	Kids Adjustable Height Rectangular Table Green: 30" x 60" x 15"-24"	AB386GR	\$293.55
8	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Green: 13 ½"	EE513GR	\$683.92
1	Kids Adjustable Height Round Table Yellow: 42"	AB372YE	\$322.05
4	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Yellow: 13 ½"	EE513YE	\$341.96
1	Toddler Sand and Water Table: 20" x 42" x 23"	LC982	\$303.05
1	Changing Table WITHOUT Casters: 44" x 44" x 20"	AA860	\$1,072.55
10	Standard Student Chairs Black: 18"	LC517GA	\$930.90
	<b>Total Cost of Projects Combined</b>		<b>\$15,284.17</b>
<b>SECTION TOTAL</b>		<b>65</b>	
<b>TOTAL TABULATED SCORE</b>		<b>100</b>	<b>35</b>
Notes:	Respondent did not submit pricing for all project items. Total project cost tabulations could not be completed.		

Reference	Specification	Points Possible	Points Awarded
<i>General Specifications Scoring</i>			
	Respondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required.	2	2
	Respondent has provided completed solicitation Cost Proposal Sheet(s), as required.	5	5
	Respondent has provided completed Reference Form, as required.	6	6
	Respondent provided Brochures (Product Detail), as required.	5	5
	Respondent has provided Detailed Timeline, as required.	5	0
	Respondent has provided completed solicitation Required Forms sheet (signed), as required.	5	5
	Respondent provided completed Business Capability Form, as required.	7	7
<b>SECTION TOTAL</b>		<b>35</b>	<b>30</b>
<i>Pricing Analysis</i>			
1	Four-in-one Toddler Kitchen: 47 ¾" x 13 ¾" x 40"		No Bid
1	Heavy Duty Spacemaker Storage Unit: 48" x 35" x 14 7/8"		No Bid
2	Storage Cabinet Wood: 29.61" x 16.02" x 71.50"		No Bid
1	18 ½" Heavy Duty Traditional Classroom Chair with Casters Chrome Frame		No Bid
1	Play Store and Puppet Theater with Dry-Erase Panels: 49 ½" x 15" x 49"		No Bid
2	5-Section Coat Locker: 48" x 15" x 50 ½"		\$1,348.86
1	Library Book Display: 27.5" x 36" x 13.5"		\$265.56
1	2-Shelf Bookcase (Metal or Wood): Metal 34 ½" x 12 5/8" x 41"/Wood 42" x 48"		No Bid
2	25 Cubbies Storage Cabinet with Trays: 35 ½" x 48" x 15"		\$1,602.68
4	All Purpose Storage Unit: 35 ½" x 48" x 15"		\$2,306.72
1	Kids Adjustable Height Rectangular Table Red: 30" x 60" x 15"-24"		No Bid
8	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Red: 13 ½"		No Bid
1	Kids Adjustable Height Rectangular Table Blue: 30" x 60" x 15"-24"		No Bid
8	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Blue: 13 ½"		No Bid
1	Kids Adjustable Height Rectangular Table Green: 30" x 60" x 15"-24"		No Bid
8	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Green: 13 ½"		No Bid
1	Kids Adjustable Height Round Table Yellow: 42"		No Bid
4	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Yellow: 13 ½"		No Bid
1	Toddler Sand and Water Table: 20" x 42" x 23"		\$288.96
1	Changing Table WITHOUT Casters: 44" x 44" x 20"		No Bid
10	Standard Student Chairs Black: 18"		No Bid
	<b>Total Cost of Projects Combined</b>		<b>\$5,812.78</b>
<b>SECTION TOTAL</b>		<b>65</b>	
<b>TOTAL TABULATED SCORE</b>		<b>100</b>	<b>30</b>
Notes:	Respondent did not provide a detailed timeline, as required.	-5 Points	
	Respondent did not submit pricing for all project items. Total project cost tabulations could not be completed.		

Reference	Specification	Points Possible	Points Awarded
<i>General Specifications Scoring</i>			
	Respondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required.	2	2
	Respondent has provided completed solicitation Cost Proposal Sheet(s), as required.	5	5
	Respondent has provided completed Reference Form, as required.	6	6
	Respondent provided Brochures (Product Detail), as required.	5	5
	Respondent has provided Detailed Timeline, as required.	5	5
	Respondent has provided completed solicitation Required Forms sheet (signed), as required.	5	5
	Respondent provided completed Business Capability Form, as required.	7	7
<b>SECTION TOTAL</b>		<b>35</b>	<b>35</b>
<i>Pricing Analysis</i>			
1	Four-in-one Toddler Kitchen: 47 ¾" x 13 ¾" x 40"		\$611.00
1	Heavy Duty Spacemaker Storage Unit: 48" x 35" x 14 7/8"		\$732.06
2	Storage Cabinet Wood: 29.61" x 16.02" x 71.50"		\$1,519.56
1	18 ½" Heavy Duty Traditional Classroom Chair with Casters Chrome Frame		\$89.00
1	Play Store and Puppet Theater with Dry-Erase Panels: 49 ½" x 15" x 49"		\$412.02
2	5-Section Coat Locker: 48" x 15" x 50 ½"		\$1,136.52
1	Library Book Display: 27.5" x 36" x 13.5"		\$255.78
1	2-Shelf Bookcase (Metal or Wood): Metal 34 ½" x 12 5/8" x 41"/Wood 42" x 48"		\$430.29
2	25 Cubbies Storage Cabinet with Trays: 35 ½" x 48" x 15"		\$1,408.68
4	All Purpose Storage Unit: 35 ½" x 48" x 15"		\$1,713.60
1	Kids Adjustable Height Rectangular Table Red: 30" x 60" x 15"-24"		\$254.00
8	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Red: 13 ½"		\$408.00
1	Kids Adjustable Height Rectangular Table Blue: 30" x 60" x 15"-24"		\$254.00
8	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Blue: 13 ½"		\$408.00
1	Kids Adjustable Height Rectangular Table Green: 30" x 60" x 15"-24"		\$254.00
8	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Green: 13 ½"		\$408.00
1	Kids Adjustable Height Round Table Yellow: 42"		\$254.00
4	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Yellow: 13 ½"		\$204.00
1	Toddler Sand and Water Table: 20" x 42" x 23"		\$404.36
1	Changing Table WITHOUT Casters: 44" x 44" x 20"		\$715.68
10	Standard Student Chairs Black: 18"		\$470.00
	<b>Total Cost of Projects Combined</b>		<b>\$12,342.55</b>
<b>SECTION TOTAL</b>		<b>65</b>	<b>61.8</b>
<b>TOTAL TABULATED SCORE</b>		<b>100</b>	<b>96.8</b>
Notes:			

Reference	Specification	Points Possible	Points Awarded
<i>General Specifications Scoring</i>			
	Respondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required.	2	2
	Respondent has provided completed solicitation Cost Proposal Sheet(s), as required.	5	5
	Respondent has provided completed Reference Form, as required.	6	6
	Respondent provided Brochures (Product Detail), as required.	5	5
	Respondent has provided Detailed Timeline, as required.	5	5
	Respondent has provided completed solicitation Required Forms sheet (signed), as required.	5	5
	Respondent provided completed Business Capability Form, as required.	7	7
<b>SECTION TOTAL</b>		<b>35</b>	<b>35</b>
<i>Pricing Analysis</i>			
1	Four-in-one Toddler Kitchen: 47 ¾" x 13 ¾" x 40"		\$634.00
1	Heavy Duty Spacemaker Storage Unit: 48" x 35" x 14 7/8"		\$516.86
2	Storage Cabinet Wood: 29.61" x 16.02" x 71.50"		\$1,277.12
1	18 ½" Heavy Duty Traditional Classroom Chair with Casters Chrome Frame		\$121.11
1	Play Store and Puppet Theater with Dry-Erase Panels: 49 ½" x 15" x 49"		\$437.77
2	5-Section Coat Locker: 48" x 15" x 50 ½"		\$1,039.50
1	Library Book Display: 27.5" x 36" x 13.5"		\$232.69
1	2-Shelf Bookcase (Metal or Wood): Metal 34 ½" x 12 5/8" x 41"/Wood 42" x 48"		\$369.29
2	25 Cubbies Storage Cabinet with Trays: 35 ½" x 48" x 15"		\$1,164.64
4	All Purpose Storage Unit: 35 ½" x 48" x 15"		\$1,610.12
1	Kids Adjustable Height Rectangular Table Red: 30" x 60" x 15"-24"		\$227.45
8	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Red: 13 ½"		\$415.84
1	Kids Adjustable Height Rectangular Table Blue: 30" x 60" x 15"-24"		\$227.45
8	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Blue: 13 ½"		\$415.84
1	Kids Adjustable Height Rectangular Table Green: 30" x 60" x 15"-24"		\$227.45
8	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Green: 13 ½"		\$415.84
1	Kids Adjustable Height Round Table Yellow: 42"		\$215.91
4	Kids Color Stacking Chairs Yellow: 13 ½"		\$207.92
1	Toddler Sand and Water Table: 20" x 42" x 23"		\$737.08
1	Changing Table WITHOUT Casters: 44" x 44" x 20"		\$737.40
10	Standard Student Chairs Black: 18"		\$510.30
	<b>Total Cost of Projects Combined</b>		<b>\$11,741.58</b>
<b>SECTION TOTAL</b>		<b>65</b>	<b>65</b>
<b>TOTAL TABULATED SCORE</b>		<b>100</b>	<b>100</b>
Notes:			